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"Every minute you spend wishing you did something is a minute you spend not doing it."
~Chris DiCroce

Tired of mortgage payments and unfulfilling jobs, Chris and Melody, along with their dog Jet, sold their
house and almost everything they owned to move onto a 35 foot sailboat.

This is the story of a leap of faith and their attempt to break away. From making the decision, to the emotions
of finding the right boat, selling everything, and finally telling friends, family, and bosses.

In the process, they soon discovered that their greatest triumphs often came from their greatest challenges.

Champagne wishes and caviar dreams fell prey to their bologna sandwich and Miller High Life budget. Boat
breakdowns, tropical storms and over-extended bank accounts brought them face to face with the reality that
things don't always go as planned, but sometimes... that's the best plan.

Light-hearted, humorous, and sometimes sad, this story will draw you in you with its unique look at life on a
sailboat and the emotions that come with it.

If you've ever wanted to quit your job and move onto a boat, or have dreams of location independence and
travel, this is a book you should read.
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From reader reviews:

Nelson Gendron:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your knowledge
by the book entitled You Gotta Go To Know. Try to stumble through book You Gotta Go To Know as your
buddy. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside that of course make
you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you considerably more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we should make new experience in addition
to knowledge with this book.

Stephen Vancleave:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people
in the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above.
Every person has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book You Gotta Go To Know.
All type of book would you see on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social
media.

James Roberts:

Why? Because this You Gotta Go To Know is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for
you to snap this but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book alongside it was
fantastic author who also write the book in such wonderful way makes the content inside easier to
understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of
positive aspects than the other book include such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Robert Poulin:

A lot of reserve has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
known as of book You Gotta Go To Know. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind
the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most essential that, you
must aware about guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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