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Flannery O'Connor was only the second twentieth-century writer (after William Faulkner) to have her work
collected for the Library of America, the definitive edition of American authors. Fifty years after her death,
O'Connor's fiction still retains its original power and pertinence. For those who know nothing of O'Connor
and her work, this study by Ralph C. Wood offers one of the finest introductions available. For those looking
to deepen their appreciation of this literary icon, it breaks important new ground.

Unique to Wood's approach is his concern to show how O'Connor's stories, novels, and essays impinge on
America's cultural and ecclesial condition. He uses O'Connor's work as a window onto its own regional and
religious ethos. Indeed, he argues here that O'Connor's fiction has lasting, even universal, significance
precisely because it is rooted in the confessional witness of her Roman Catholicism and in the Christ-haunted
character of the American South.

According to Wood, it is this O'Connor -- the believer and the Southerner -- who helps us at once to confront
the hardest cultural questions and to propose the profoundest religious answers to them. His book is thus far
more than a critical analysis of O'Connor's writing; in fact, it is principally devoted to cultural and
theological criticism by way of O'Connor's searing insights into our time and place.

These are some of the engaging moral and religious questions that Wood explores: the role of religious
fundamentalism in American culture and in relation to both Protestant liberalism and Roman Catholicism;
the practice of racial slavery and its continuing legacy in the literature and religion of the South; the debate
over Southern identity, especially whether it is a culture rooted in ancient or modern values; the place of
preaching and the sacraments in secular society and dying Christendom; and the lure of nihilism in
contemporary American culture.

Splendidly illuminating both O'Connor herself and the American mind, Wood's Flannery O'Connor and the
Christ-Haunted South will inform and fascinate a wide range of readers, from lovers of literature to those
seriously engaged with religious history, cultural analysis, or the American South.
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From reader reviews:

Bessie Papp:

The guide untitled Flannery O'Connor and the Christ-Haunted South is the book that recommended to you to
read. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to a person. The language that creator
use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely
accurate. You also might get the e-book of Flannery O'Connor and the Christ-Haunted South from the
publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

George Bolin:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Flannery O'Connor and the
Christ-Haunted South can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks
have than the others?

Jeffrey Spencer:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you need to do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of the books in the top checklist
in your reading list will be Flannery O'Connor and the Christ-Haunted South. This book that is certainly
qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward and
review this guide you can get many advantages.

Roy Hanson:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen want book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world.
By book Flannery O'Connor and the Christ-Haunted South we can have more advantage. Don't someone to
be creative people? To be creative person must love to read a book. Only choose the best book that
acceptable with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book Flannery O'Connor and the
Christ-Haunted South. You can more attractive than now.
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